Project :
MI-985 SOFTBALL FIELD PRESSBOX

Contract / Bidders

SUMMARY OF BIDS
MILLERSVILLE UNIVERSITY

Bid Opening: 10/18/07, 11:30 AM

MI-985.G, GENERAL CONSTRUCTION Base Bid 1 Base Bid 2
Bertolet Construction Corporation $ 250,332.00 | $ 269,080.00
CCL Associates, Inc. No Bid

Donald E. Reisinger, Inc. $ 342,800.00 | $ 342,800.00
Dueck Construction $ 279,969.00 | $ 293,959.00
East Coast Contracting, Inc. $ 247,300.00 | $ 260,000.00
Miller & Norford Incorporated $ 268,000.00 | $ 277,000.00
Penncrest Construction $ 255,000.00 | $ 255,000.00
Purcell Construction $ 231,700.00 | $ 232,500.00
Sha-Nic, Inc. No Bid

Triple H Construction LLC $ 230,300.00 | $ 231,300.00
Uhrig Construction $ 282,237.00 | $ 298,237.00
MI-985.P, PLUMBING Base Bid 1 Base Bid 2

Leo Kob Co., Inc. $ 18,425.00 | $ 18,425.00
McClure Company $ 16,799.00 | $ 16,799.00
MidState Mechanical and Electrical LLC No Bid

MI-985.E, ELECTRICAL Base Bid 1 Base Bid 2

CCL Associates, Inc. No Bid

John E. Fullerton, Inc. $ 64,688.00

Leer Electric, Inc. $ 57,500.00 | $ 57,500.00
Legacy Electrical Services, Inc. $ 54,938.86 | $ 54,938.86
MidState Mechanical & Electrical LLC No Bid

PSQ, Inc. No Bid

Shannon A. Smith, Inc. $ 100,425.00 | $ 100,425.00
SP Construction & Design, Inc. $ 87,500.00

Weaver Electric No Bid

Wescott Electric Company $ 68,000.00 | $ 68,000.00




