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Video Topic Who Its For Description Link to Video 

Entry Introduction Everyone 

This is where you should 
start. It will give you a 
brief description of 
everything you will need 
to know to prepare for 
the parade. 

Welcome Video 

Rules and Guidelines Everyone 

These are the rules and 
guidelines we are all 
asked to follow. They are 
not only for the safety of 
us and others, but they 
are also based on 
contracts with the 
borough and the high 
school. 

Guidelines 

Definitions of Entries Everyone 

This is a brief description 
of what type of entry you 
may have (i.e., float vs. 
band) 

Entry Definitions 

Shuttle Bus Instructions Everyone 

This is a map and 
description of how the 
free shuttle system works 
for you and your whole 
group. 

Shuttle 

Division Instructions Groups in Division A 

This is only for anyone 
assigned to division A as 
it will explain what you 
will be doing on the 
morning of October 14th. 

Division A 

Division Instructions Groups in Division B 

This is only for anyone 
assigned to division B as it 
will explain what you will 
be doing on the morning 
of October 14th. 

Division B 

Division Instructions Groups in Division C 

This is only for anyone 
assigned to division C as it 
will explain what you will 
be doing on the morning 
of October 14th. 

Division C 

 

file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Entry%20Introduction.mp4
file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Parade%20Guidelines%20and%20Rules.mp4
file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Definitions%20of%20Entry%20Types.mp4
file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Shuttle.mp4
file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Division%20A%20Instructions.mp4
file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Division%20B%20Instructions.mp4
file:///C:/Users/rbuchannan/OneDrive%20-%20Millersville%20University%20(1)/Documents/Parade%20Videos/Division%20C%20Instructions.mp4

